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TRAVEL NEWS FROM DANNY’S 
LUXURY CRUISE VACATIONS! 



While our name says cruises, we are more than 
amazing cruise vacations. We also offer amazing all 
inclusive resort vacations. One of the companies 
that I work very closely with is Karisma Hotels & 
Resorts.


Properties in their portfolio are El Dorado, 
Generations, Margaritaville Island Reserve, 
Nickelodeon, Hidden Beach, Azul and Karisma 
Villas. I have stayed at a two of their resorts and 
they are fantastic. The food and service, AMAZING!
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Some of the resorts are adults only like El Dorado 
and some are family friendly like Generations and 
Nickelodeon. 


	 	 	 


I have visited many of these properties in the Riviera 
Maya area of Mexico. There are also properties in 
Jamaica and the Dominican Republic. 


Besides being able to offer you amazing resorts with 
amazing food and service, we have the ability to 
offer you transfers to and from the airport as well as 
excursions. 	We can pre purchase the excursions for 
you so that you can plan your stay accordingly. 


Plan something in the morning and relax at the pool 
or the beach in the afternoon. Whether you want to 
see the pyramids in Tulum or go jet skiing we can 
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set this all up for you. I also have amazing contacts 
at the resorts. 	 	 	 	 	 


Let us know where you would like to go. In the 
meantime click here to like us on Facebook. 


Subscribe to my YouTube channel by clicking here.


You can reach me at 201-664-0142 or by email at 
Danny@dannysluxurycruisevacations.com.


Your Vacation Advisor,


Danny


